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             BIRLA PUBLIC SCHOOL GANGANAGAR 

(A UNIT OF BIRLA EDUCATION TRUST PILANI) 

                                                        (A step ahead……) 
Session 2025-26 

 

     

 
Day & Date-23- 07- 2025 (Wednesday) 

The Investiture Ceremony 2025 of Birla Public School Ganganagar was held with great zeal 
and dignity on 23 July 2025, in the presence of students, staff, and esteemed guests. This 
solemn occasion marked the official induction of the newly elected Student Council who are 
ready to lead with purpose and integrity. 

The ceremony commenced with a formal welcome and the lighting of the ceremonial lamp, 
symbolizing the dispelling of darkness and the rise of knowledge and leadership. Mr. Satish 
Saharan, an esteemed alumnus and former Sarpanch of Choutala, graced the event as the 
Guest of Honour, along with our Officiating Principal, Mr. Sanjeev Kumar. 

A sapling was presented to the guest as a token of gratitude and hope, followed by cultural 
performances including an instrumental rendition of "Kesariya Balam" and a soulful group 
song "Mann Ki Veena", celebrating unity and tradition. 

The vibrant group dance “Nritya Tarang” mesmerized the audience and added energy to the 
celebration. 
The highlight of the ceremony was the investiture of the Student Council, where students 
received their badges of honour and pledged their commitment to lead with sincerity and 
dedication. Positions including School Captains, House Captains, Discipline Captains, Co-
curricular, Sports, Assembly, Display Board, and Student Welfare Captains were awarded. 

The newly appointed leaders, led by the School Captain Boy and Girl, delivered a confident 
and heartfelt Acceptance Speech, expressing their gratitude and vision for the year ahead. 
The Oath of Office was administered by the Officiating Principal, sealing the moment of 
responsibility. 

The Chief Guest,  Mr. Dalip Jakhar, shared inspiring words, motivating students to be rooted 
in values while striving for excellence. Officiating Principal, Mr. Sanjeev Kumar, in his 
address, emphasized the role of young leaders in shaping the future of the school and society. 

A group photograph was taken to commemorate this proud moment, and the event 
concluded with the Vote of Thanks , followed by the National Anthem. 

The Investiture Ceremony 2025 stood as a proud reminder of the faith BPSG places in its 
students — not just to follow, but to lead with courage, commitment, and compassion. 
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1.) Poster of the Event    2.) Circular of the Event 

                   
 

3.) Evidence of Photograph 

 

                                   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
                                                                    
 
 
 

 
 
 

             
 

                                         
 
 
 
 
 
 
Submitted: Ms. Nisha Thakur 


